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Visi pienakumi nokartoti:




From:
Subject:
Date:
To:

Ce:

LF Kasieris <lfkasieris@gmail.com>

Re: ProiektLF06V29

2009. gada 4. septembris 10:11 ‘56 GMT-04:00

Valdis Berzins <lfpriekssedis@ gmail.com>

Aija Mazsile <mazsilis@hotmail.com>, Aija Mazsilis <lfvietnieks@gmail.com>

Hello, Valdis,

The second $1,000 was transferred to Ms. Sinka's account today, Sept. 4. Please advise Ms. Sinka. Thanks, Tija.

On Aug 29, 2009, at 8:47 AM. Valdis Berzins wrote:

Hello, Tija!

Please use this as authorization to make a transfer of $2000 to Maija Sinka's account, account number as noted below. | have
received the final documentation as well as a copy of the book, "Musu valoda |I" by Janis Kuskis, as well as an accompanying CD,
"Kas valda valodu, valda pratu,” for the Foundations archives. Maija Sinka has acknowledged receipt of the initial transfer. With
this final transaction/transter, project LFOBV29 can be considered as closed.

valdis Berzins

2009/8/19 Valdis Bérzind <lfpriekssedis@gmail.com>
Hello!

| have received the preliminary accounting info for project LFOBV29, book by J. Kuska on Latvian language problems. The
project was granted $3900 USD. | am authorizing you to make the necessary transfer to pay $1900 of the amount. The
remainder will be authorized for payment upon receipt of the final paperwork, as well as a copy of the book. Payment to be
made to: Maija Sinka, Swedbank, Swift/BIC HABALV22, account nr. LVO7HABAO151A15806001.

Thank you!
Valdis Berzins




From: Valdis Bérzins <lfpriekssedis@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: ProjektLFO6V29
Date: 2009. gada 29. augusts 09:47:07 GMT-04:00

To: LF Kasieris <lfkasieris@gmail.com>
Cc: Tija Karkle <tijalaura@comcast.net>, Aija Mazsile <mazsilis@hotmail.com>, Aija Mazsilis <lfvietnieks@gmail.com>

Hello, Tija!

Please use this as authorization to make a transfer of $2000 to Maija Sinka's account, account number as noted below. | have
received the final documentation as well as a copy of the book, "Musu valoda 1" by Janis Kuskis, as well as an accompanying CD,
"Kas valda valodu, valda pratu," for the Foundations archives. Maija Sinka has acknowledged receipt of the initial transfer. With this
final transaction/transfer, project LFO6V29 can be considered as closed.

Valdis Berzins

2009/8/19 Valdis Berzin$ <lfpriekssedis@gmail.com>
Hello!

| have received the preliminary accounting info for project LF06V29, book by J. Kuska on Latvian language problems. The project
was granted $3900 USD. | am authorizing you to make the necessary transfer to pay $1900 of the amount. The remainder will be
authorized for payment upon receipt of the final paperwork, as well as a copy of the book. Payment to be made to: Maija Sinka,
Swedbank, Swift/BIC HABALV22, account nr. LVO7HABAO151A15806001.

Thank you!
Valdis Berzins




From: Valdis Berzins <Ifpriekssedis@gmail.com>
Subject: ProjektLF06V29
Date: 2009. gada 19. augusts 04:06:35 GMT-04:00
To: LF Kasieris <Ifkasieris@gmail.com>
Cc: Tija Karkle <tijalaura@comcast.net>, Aija Mazsile <mazsilis@hotmail.com>, Aija Mazsilis <lfvietnieks@gmail.com>

Hello!

| have received the preliminary accounting info for project LFO6V29, book by J. Kuska on Latvian language problems. The project
was granted $3900 USD. | am authorizing you to make the necessary transfer to pay $1900 of the amount. The remainder will be
authorized for payment upon receipt of the final paperwork, as well as a copy of the book. Payment to be made to: Maija Sinka,
Swedbank, Swift/BIC HABALV22, account nr. LVO7HABAO151A15806001.

Thank you!
Valdis Berzins




